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with tangible property, intellectual property is subject to ownership and protection.  
Moreover, publication establishes ownership of intellectual property.  It is essential that 
we respect the ideas and writing of others and that we scrupulously cite all sources of 
any and all ideas that are not our own.   
 
Random House Webster’s College Dictionary (2000) defines plagiarism as “the 
unauthorized use of the language and thoughts of another author and the 
representation of them as one’s own.”  There are many form⁴栀攀 

http://www.indiana.edu/~wts/pamphlets/plagiarism.shtml
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Word file through the Outline assignment link in Blazeview.  The due date for the outline 
is provided below in the course schedule.   
 
I. Introduction 

A. History of knowledge about Azolla-Anabaena symbiosis  

B. 
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spacing will be deducted in determining whether the five (5) page minimum requirement 
has been met. 
 
The term paper should begin with a Title Page (un-numbered) that shall include the title 
of the paper, name of the author, course title and number, name of instructor, and the 
submission date.  As is the case with a good story, the body of the term paper should 
have a beginning (introduction), a middle (discussion), and an end (conclusion).  Under 
the heading of Introduction, the body of the paper shall begin with a general 
introduction to the topic.  The introduction should be a brief synthesis of the knowledge 
in the area of research and the principal points and questions that will be examined in 
the Discussion section, citing references where appropriate.  Under the heading of 
Discussion, the introduction is followed by a detailed discussion of the subject 
containing references to specific scientific studies.  Here, the subject should be 
discussed in detail, citing references where appropriate.  Finally, under the heading of 
Conclusions, the body of the term paper concludes with a summary based upon the 
student’s interpretation of the articles and a summary of the current state of knowledge 
on the topic, suggesting additional kinds of research or analyses that might be done to 
explore the topic more fully or answer questions posed in the Discussion section.  Of 
course, references should be cited where appropriate.  The final section of the term 
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sources) are cited.  Although review articles and most books are secondary sources, 
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Miscellaneous Instructions.  Before beginning your research, become proficient with 
the system required by your instructor for proper citation of references.  When 
photocopying articles or other materials, use the models provided by your instructor as 
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system and presentation at least several hours before beginning the scheduled 
presentation.  Students must work with their instructor well in advance of the 
presentation to prevent last minute problems.  As a general rule, the oral presentation 
should follow the same outline and rules as the term paper.  In particular, plagiarism 
rules apply equally to oral presentations.  All sources of materials, including 
photographs, diagrams, graphs, etc., 
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Wednesday, 21 April, 5:00 – 6:50 PM – Third week of oral presentations 
Wednesday, 28 April, 5:00 – 6:50 PM – Fourth week of oral presentations 
 
Schedule of Oral Presentations  
The final schedule with assigned dates for individual presentations will be posted in 
Blazeview. 
 
Wednesday, 7 Apr 2021 
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Plagiarism Awareness Assessment, resulting in final course grade of Unsatisfactory; 
and (5) 40 points will be deducted from the final course grade for failure to employ and 
properly cite at least seven published references, at least five of which must be primary 
literature, 


